
2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  1 

 
This document contains excerpts of the flood provisions from the 2015 editions of the New 

Jersey Uniform Construction Code:  Administrative Provisions (N.J.A.C. § 5:23-2.14), Building 
Subcode (N.J.A.C. § 5:23-3.14), One- and Two-Family Dwelling Subcode (N.J.A.C. § 5:23-

3.21), and Rehabilitation Subcode (N.J.A.C. § 5:23-6)   
 

Prepared by the New Jersey Association for Floodplain Management (www.njafm.org)  
 

Portions of this publication reproduce excerpts from the International Building Code 2015, New 

Jersey Edition and the International Residential Code 2015, New Jersey Edition, International 

Code Council, Inc., Washington, D.C. Reproduced with permission. All rights reserved. www.iccsafe.org 

 

 
N.J.A.C. 5:23-2. Administrative and Enforcement Provisions 

http://www.state.nj.us/dca/divisions/codes/codreg/ucc.html 

 
§ 5:23-2.15 Construction permits—application 
 
(f) Plans, plan review, plan release:  
1. Plans and specifications:  
ix. Architect's or engineer's seal: The seal and signature of the registered architect or licensed 
engineer who prepared the plans shall be affixed to each sheet of each copy of the plans submitted and 
on the first or title sheet of the specifications and any additional supportive information submitted. 

(1) Exception: The construction official shall waive the requirement for sealed plans in the case of a 
single family home owner who had prepared his or her own plans for the construction, addition, 
reconstruction, alteration, renovation, or repair of a detached structure used or intended to be used 
exclusively as his or her private residence providing that the owner shall submit an affidavit attesting 
to the fact that he or she has personally prepared the plans and provided further that said plans are in 
the opinion of the construction official, and appropriate subcode official, legible and complete for 
purposes of ensuring compliance with the regulations. This exception shall not apply to the structural 
design, specifications, and plans for new construction or substantial improvement of a home in a V 
zone in a flood hazard area, which must be developed or reviewed by a registered architect or 
licensed engineer pursuant to the National Flood Insurance Program rules, 44 CFR 60.3. 

 
§ 5:23-2.18 Inspections 
(b) Inspections during progress of work 
ii. Foundations and all walls up to grade level prior to covering or backfilling: [partial shown] 

(2) For new construction, additions, and work that is determined to be a substantial improvement 
pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:23-6.3A, the foundation location survey, including the lowest floor elevation 
and as-built elevation documentation, for a building that is located in a flood hazard area shall be 
submitted to the construction official and to the local floodplain administrator and shall include 
elevation certificates as required by section 1612.5 of the building subcode or section R322.1.10 of 
the one- and two-family dwelling subcode; the documentation and certificates shall be submitted prior 
to further vertical construction; 

 

  

http://www.njafm.org/
http://www.state.nj.us/dca/divisions/codes/codreg/ucc.html


2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  2 

2015 NJ UCC Building Subcode 
http://codes.iccsafe.org/app/book/toc/2015/New_Jersey/building/index.html  

 
SECTION 202  DEFINITIONS 

 
 [BS] BASE FLOOD. The flood having a 1-percent chance of being equaled or exceeded in any given 
year. 
 
[BS] BASE FLOOD ELEVATION. The elevation of the base flood, including wave height, relative to the 
National Geodetic Vertical Datum (NGVD), North American Vertical Datum (NAVD) or other datum 
specified on the Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM). 
 
[BS] BASEMENT (for flood loads). The portion of a building having its floor subgrade (below ground 
level) on all sides. This definition of “Basement” is limited in application to the provisions of Section 1612.   
 
BASEMENT. A story that is not a story above grade plane (see “Story above grade plane”). This 
definition of “Basement” does not apply to the provisions of Section 1612 for flood loads. 
 
[BS] COASTAL A ZONE. Area within a special flood hazard area, landward of a V zone or landward of 
an open coast without mapped coastal high hazard areas. In a coastal A zone, the principal source of 
flooding must be astronomical tides, storm surges, seiches or tsunamis, not riverine flooding. During the 
base flood conditions, the potential for breaking wave height shall be greater than or equal to 1 ½ feet 
(457 mm). The inland limit of the coastal A zone is (a) the Limit of Moderate Wave Action if delineated on 
a FIRM, or (b) designated by the authority having jurisdiction.  
 
[BS] COASTAL HIGH HAZARD AREA. Area within the special flood hazard area extending from 
offshore to the inland limit of a primary dune along an open coast and any other area that is subject to 
high-velocity wave action from storms or seismic sources, and shown on a Flood Insurance Rate Map 
(FIRM) or other flood hazard map as velocity Zone V, VO, VE or V1-30.  
 
[BS] DESIGN FLOOD. The flood associated with the greater of the following two areas: 

1. Area with a flood plain subject to a 1-percent or greater chance of flooding in any year. 
2. Area designated as a flood hazard area on a community’s flood hazard map, or otherwise legally 

designated.  
 
[BS] DESIGN FLOOD ELEVATION. The elevation of the “design flood,” including wave height, relative to 
the datum specified on the community’s legally designated flood hazard map. In areas designated as 
Zone AO, the design flood elevation shall be the elevation of the highest existing grade of the building’s 
perimeter plus the depth number (in feet) specified on the flood hazard map. In areas designated as Zone 
AO where a depth number is not specified on the map, the depth number shall be taken as being equal to 
2 feet (610 mm).  
 
[BS] DRY FLOODPROOFING. A combination of design modifications that results in a building or 
structure, including the attendant utilities and equipment and sanitary facilities, being water tight with walls 
substantially impermeable to the passage of water and with structural components having the capacity to 
resist loads as identified in ASCE 7.   
 
[BS] FLOOD or FLOODING. A general and temporary condition of partial or complete inundation of 
normally dry land from: 

1. The overflow of inland or tidal waters. 
2. The unusual and rapid accumulation or runoff of surface waters from any source. 

 
[BS] FLOOD DAMAGE-RESISTANT MATERIALS. Any construction material capable of withstanding 
direct and prolonged contact with floodwaters without sustaining any damage that requires more than 
cosmetic repair. 

http://codes.iccsafe.org/app/book/toc/2015/New_Jersey/building/index.html


2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  3 

 
[BS] FLOOD HAZARD AREA. The greater of the following two areas: 

1. The area within a flood plain subject to a 1-percent or greater chance of flooding in any year. 
2. The area designated as a flood hazard area on a community’s flood hazard map, or otherwise 

legally designated. 
 
[BS] FLOOD INSURANCE RATE MAP (FIRM). An official map of a community on which the Federal 
Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) has delineated both the special flood hazard areas and the risk 
premium zones applicable to the community. 
 
[BS] FLOOD INSURANCE STUDY. The official report provided by the Federal Emergency Management 
Agency containing the Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM), the Flood Boundary and Floodway Map 
(FBFM), the water surface elevation of the base flood and supporting technical data. 
 
[BS] FLOODWAY. The channel of the river, creek or other watercourse and the adjacent land areas that 
must be reserved in order to discharge the base flood without cumulatively increasing the water surface 
elevation more than a designated height. 
 
[BS] LIMIT OF MODERATE WAVE ACTION. Line shown on FIRMs to indicate the inland limit of the 1 ½-
foot (457 mm) breaking wave height during the base flood. 
 
[BS] LOWEST FLOOR. The floor of the lowest enclosed area, including basement, but excluding any 
unfinished or flood-resistant enclosure, usable solely for vehicle parking, building access or limited 
storage provided that such enclosure is not built so as to render the structure in violation of Section 1612. 
 
[BS] SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD AREA. The land area subject to flood hazards and shown on a Flood 
Insurance Rate Map or other flood hazard map as Zone A, AE, A1-30, A99, AR, AO, AH, V, VO, VE, or 
V1-30. 
 

CHAPTER 8  INTERIOR FINISHES 
 

801.5 Applicability. For buildings in flood hazard areas as established in Section 1612.3, interior 
finishes, trim and decorative materials below the elevation required by Section 1612 shall be flood-
damage-resistant-materials.   
 

CHAPTER 11  ACCESSIBILITY 
 
1107.7.3 [General exceptions] Design flood elevation. The required number of Type A units and Type 
B units shall not apply to a site where the required elevation of the lowest floor or the lowest horizontal 
structural building members of nonelevator buildings are at or above the design flood elevation resulting 
in:   

1. A difference in elevation between the minimum required floor elevation at the primary entrances 
and vehicular and pedestrian arrival points within 50 feet (15,240 mm) exceeding 30 inches (762 
mm), and 

2. A slope exceeding 10 percent between the minimum required floor elevation at the primary 
entrances and vehicular and pedestrian arrival points within 50 feet (15,240 mm). 
Where no such arrival points are within 50 feet (15 240 mm) of the primary entrances, the closest 
arrival points shall be used. 

 

CHAPTER 12  INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT 
 

1203.4  Under-floor ventilation. 
1203.4.2 Exceptions. The following are exceptions to Sections 1203.4 and 1203.4.1: 



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  4 

5. For buildings in flood hazard areas as established in Section 1612.3, the openings for under-
floor ventilation shall be deemed as meeting the flood opening requirements of ASCE 24 provided 
that the ventilation openings are designed and installed in accordance with ASCE 24.  

 
CHAPTER 14  EXTERIOR WALLS 

  
[BS] 1403.6 Flood resistance. For buildings in flood hazard areas as established in Section 1612.3, 
exterior walls extending below the elevation required by Section 1612 shall be constructed with flood 
damage-resistant materials. 
 
[BS] 1403.7 Flood resistance for coastal high hazard areas and coastal A zones. For buildings in 
coastal high hazard areas and coastal A zones as established in Section 1612.3, electrical, mechanical 
and plumbing system components shall not be mounted on or penetrate through exterior walls that are 
designed to break away under flood loads.   
 

CHAPTER 16  STRUCTURAL DESIGN REQUIREMENTS 
 

SECTION 1602  DEFINITIONS AND NOTATIONS 
 
NOTATIONS. 
Fa = Flood load in accordance with Chapter 5 of ASCE 7.  

SECTION 1603  CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS 
 
1603.1 General. Construction documents shall show the size, section and relative locations of structural 
members with floor levels, column centers and offsets dimensioned. The design loads and other 
information pertinent to the structural design required by Sections 1603.1.1 through 1603.1.8 shall be 
indicated on the construction documents. 

Exception: Construction documents for buildings constructed in accordance with the 
conventional light-frame construction provisions of Section 2308 shall indicate the following 
structural design information: 
1. Floor and roof live loads. 
2. Ground snow load, Pg. 
3. Ultimate design wind speed, Vult, (3-second gust), miles per hour (mph) (km/hr) and nominal 
design wind speed, Vasd, as determined in accordance with Section 1609.3.1 and wind 
exposure. 
4. Seismic design category and site class. 
5. Flood design data, if located in flood hazard areas established in Section 1612.3.   
6. Design load-bearing values of soils. 

 
1603.1.7 Flood design data. For buildings located in whole or in part in flood hazard areas as 
established in Section 1612.3, the documentation pertaining to design, if required in Section 1612.5, shall 
be included and the following information, referenced to the datum on the community’s Flood Insurance 
Rate Map (FIRM), shall be shown, regardless of whether flood loads govern the design of the building:   

1. Flood design class assigned according to ASCE 24.   
2. In flood hazard areas other than coastal hazard areas or coastal A zones, the elevation of the 
proposed lowest floor, including the basement.  
3. In flood hazard areas other than coastal hazard areas or coastal A zones, the elevation to 
which any nonresidential building will be dry floodproofed.  
4. In coastal high hazard areas and coastal A zones, the proposed elevation of the bottom of the 
lowest horizontal structural member of the lowest floor, including the basement. 

 
1605.2.1 [Load combinations using strength design or load and resistance factor design] Other 
loads. Where flood loads, Fa, are to be considered in the design, the load combinations of Section 2.3.3 
of ASCE 7 shall be used. Where self-straining loads, T, are considered in design, their structural effects in 
combination with other loads shall be determined in accordance with Section 2.3.5 of ASCE 7. Where an 



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  5 

ice-sensitive structure is subjected to loads due to atmospheric icing, the load combinations of Section 
2.3.4 of ASCE 7 shall be considered. 
 
1605.3.1.2  [Load combinations using allowable stress design] Other loads. Where flood loads, Fa, 
are to be considered in design, the load combinations of Section 2.4.2 of ASCE 7 shall be used. Where 
self-straining loads, T, are considered in design, their structural effects in combination with other loads 
shall be determined in accordance with Section 2.4.4 of ASCE 7. Where an ice-sensitive structure is 
subjected to loads due to atmospheric icing, the load combinations of Section 2.4.3 of ASCE 7 shall be 
considered.  
 

SECTION 1612  FLOOD LOADS 
 
1612.1 General. Within flood hazard areas as established in Section 1612.3, all new construction of 
buildings, structures and portions of buildings and structures, including substantial improvement and 
restoration of substantial damage to buildings and structures, shall be designed and constructed to resist 
the effects of flood hazards and flood loads. For buildings that are located in more than one flood hazard 
area, the provisions associated with the most restrictive flood hazard area shall apply.  [S24-03/04] 
 
1612.2 Definitions. The following terms are defined in Chapter 2: 
BASE FLOOD.  
BASE FLOOD ELEVATION.  
BASEMENT.  
COASTAL A ZONE.  
COASTAL HIGH HAZARD AREA. 
DESIGN FLOOD. 
DESIGN FLOOD ELEVATION. 
DRY FLOODPROOFING. 
EXISTING STRUCTURE. 
FLOOD or FLOODING. 
FLOOD DAMAGE-RESISTANT MATERIALS. 
FLOOD HAZARD AREA. 
FLOOD INSURANCE RATE MAP (FIRM).  
FLOOD INSURANCE STUDY. 
FLOODWAY. 
LOWEST FLOOR. 
SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD AREA. 
START OF CONSTRUCTION. 
SUBSTANTIAL DAMAGE. 
SUBSTANTIAL IMPROVEMENT. 
 
1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the applicable governing 
authority shall adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. The flood hazard map shall include, at a 
minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in 
an engineering report entitled “The Flood Insurance Study for [INSERT NAME OF JURISDICTION],” 
dated [INSERT DATE OF ISSUANCE], as amended or revised with the accompanying Flood Insurance 
Rate Map (FIRM) and Flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related supporting data along with 
any revisions thereto. The adopted flood hazard map and supporting data are hereby adopted by 
reference and declared to be part of this section. 

 
1612.3.1 Design flood elevations. Where design flood elevations are not included in the flood 
hazard areas established in Section 1612.3, or where floodways are not designated, the building 
official is authorized to require the applicant to:  

1. Obtain and reasonably utilize any design flood elevation and floodway data available 
from a federal, state, or other source; or  

2. Determine the design flood elevation and/or floodway in accordance with accepted 
hydrologic and hydraulic engineering practices used to define special flood hazard areas.  



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  6 

Determinations shall be undertaken by a registered design professional who shall 
document that the technical methods used reflect currently accepted engineering 
practice.   

 
1612.3.2 Determination of impacts. In riverine flood hazard areas where design flood elevations 
are specified but floodways have not been designated, the applicant shall provide a floodway 
analysis that demonstrates that the proposed work will not increase the design flood elevation 
more than 1 foot (305 mm) at any point within the jurisdiction of the applicable governing 
authority.  

 
1612.4 Design and construction. The design and construction of buildings and structures located in 
flood hazard areas, including coastal high hazard areas and coastal A zones, shall be in accordance with 
Chapter 5 of ASCE 7 and ASCE 24.  
 
1612.5 Flood hazard documentation. The following documentation shall be prepared and sealed by a 
registered design professional and submitted to the building official: [Note: refer to administrative 
provisions of the UCC § 5:23-2.18 Inspections instead of Sections 110.3.3 and 110.3.10.1.] 

1. For construction in flood hazard areas other than coastal high hazard areas or coastal A zones: 
1.1. The elevation of the lowest floor, including the basement, as required by the lowest 
floor elevation inspection in Section 110.3.3 and for the final inspection in Section 
110.3.10.1. 
1.2. For fully enclosed areas below the design flood elevation where provisions to allow 
for the automatic entry and exit of floodwaters do not meet the minimum requirements in 
Section 2.7.2.1 of ASCE 24, construction documents shall include a statement that the 
design will provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces in accordance with Section 
2.7.2.2 of ASCE 24.  
1.3 For dry floodproofed nonresidential buildings, construction documents shall include a 
statement that the dry floodproofing is designed in accordance with ASCE 24. 

2. For construction in coastal high hazard areas and coastal A zones: 
2.1. The elevation of the bottom of the lowest horizontal structural member as required by 
the lowest floor elevation inspection in Section 110.3.3 and for the final inspection in 
Section 110.3.10.1. 
2.2. Construction documents shall include a statement that the building is designed in 
accordance with ASCE 24, including that the pile or column foundation and building or 
structure to be attached thereto is designed to be anchored to resist flotation, collapse 
and lateral movement due to the effects of wind and flood loads acting simultaneously on 
all building components, and other load requirements of Chapter 16.  
2.3. For breakaway walls designed to have a resistance of more than 20 psf (0.96 kN/m2) 
determined using allowable stress design, construction documents shall include a 
statement that the breakaway wall is designed in accordance with ASCE 24.  

 
 

CHAPTER 18  SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS 
 
1801.1  Scope.  The provisions of this chapter shall apply to building and foundation systems.  
 
1804.4 [Excavation, Grading and Fill] Site grading. The ground immediately adjacent to the foundation 
shall be sloped away from the building at a slope of not less than one unit vertical in 20 units horizontal 
(5-percent slope) for a minimum distance of 10 feet (3048 mm) measured perpendicular to the face of the 
wall. If physical obstructions or lot lines prohibit 10 feet (3048 mm) of horizontal distance, a 5-percent 
slope shall be provided to an approved alternative method of diverting water away from the foundation. 
Swales used for this purpose shall be sloped a minimum of 2 percent where located within 10 feet (3048 
mm) of the building foundation. Impervious surfaces within 10 feet (3048 mm) of the building foundation 
shall be sloped a minimum of 2 percent away from the building. 



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  7 

Exception: Where climatic or soil conditions warrant, the slope of the ground away from the 
building foundation shall be permitted to be reduced to not less than one unit vertical in 48 units 
horizontal (2-percent slope). 

 
The procedure used to establish the final ground level adjacent to the foundation shall account for 

additional settlement of the backfill. 
 
1804.5 [Excavation, Grading and Fill] Grading and fill in flood hazard areas.  In flood hazard areas 
established in Section 1612.3, grading and/or fill shall not be approved: 

1. Unless such fill is placed, compacted and sloped to minimize shifting, slumping and erosion 
during the rise and fall of floodwater and, as applicable, wave action.   

2. In floodways, unless it has been demonstrated through hydrologic and hydraulic analyses 
performed by a registered design professional in accordance with standard engineering practice 
that the proposed grading or fill, or both, will not result in any increase in flood levels during the 
occurrence of the design flood. 

3. In coastal high hazard areas, unless such fill is conducted and/or placed to avoid diversion of 
water and waves toward any building or structure.   

4. Where design flood elevations are specified but floodways have not been designated, unless it 
has been demonstrated that the cumulative effect of the proposed flood hazard area 
encroachment, when combined with all other existing and anticipated flood hazard area 
encroachment, will not increase the design flood elevation more than 1 foot (305 mm) at any 
point.   

 
1805.1.2.1  [Under-floor space] Flood hazard areas. For buildings and structures in flood hazard areas 
as established in Section 1612.3, the finished ground level of an under-floor space such as a crawl space 
shall be equal to or higher than the outside finished ground level on at least one side.  

Exception: Under-floor spaces of Group R-3 buildings that meet the requirements of FEMA TB 
11.  

 
CHAPTER 27  ELECTRICAL 

 
[F] 2702.1.2 Group I-2 Occupancies. In Group I-2 occupancies, in new construction or where the 
building is substantially damaged, where an essential electrical system is located in flood hazard areas 
established in Section 1612.3 of the International Building Code, the system shall be located and installed 
in accordance with ASCE 24. 

 
CHAPTER 30  ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS 

 
3001.2 Referenced standards. Except as otherwise provided for in this code, the design, construction, 
installation, alteration, repair and maintenance of elevators and conveying systems and their components 
shall conform to ASME A17.1 with the exception of Section 1.1.3 and 1.2; Section 5.8, 5.9, and 5.11; 
Sections 7.4 through 7.7; Sections 7.9 through 7.11; ASME A17.7/CSA B44.7, ASME A19.1, ASME 
A90.1, ASME B20.1, ANSI MH29.1, ALI ALCTV and ASCE 24 for construction in flood hazard areas 
established in Section 1612.3. 

 
CHAPTER 31  SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION 

 
3102.7 Engineering design. The structure shall be designed and constructed to sustain dead loads; 
loads due to tension or inflation; live loads including wind, snow or flood and seismic loads and in 
accordance with Chapter 16. 
 

CHAPTER 35  REFERENCED STANDARDS 
 
ASCE/SEI 24-14 Flood Resistant Design and Construction 
FEMA-TB-11-01   Crawlspace Construction for Buildings   
   Located in Special Flood Hazard Areas   



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  8 

2015 NJ UCC Dwelling Subcode 
http://codes.iccsafe.org/app/book/toc/2015/New_Jersey/building/index.html  

 
CHAPTER 3  BUILDING PLANNING 

 
R301.2 Climatic and geographic design criteria. Buildings shall be constructed in accordance with the 
provisions of this code as limited by the provisions of this section. Additional criteria shall be established 
by the local jurisdiction and set forth in Table R301.2(1). 
 
Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria  
[Note:  New Jersey DCA advises it may pursue modifying Table R301.2(1) to refer to local adoption of 
Flood Insurance Studies and Flood Insurance Rate Maps; where reference to Table R301.2(1) appears in 
the following provisions, it refers to the FIS/FIRMs adopted by communities.]  
 
R301.2.4 Floodplain construction. Buildings and structures constructed in whole or in part in flood 
hazard areas (including A or V Zones) as established in Table R301.2(1), and substantial improvement 
and restoration of substantial damage of buildings and structures in flood hazard areas, shall be designed 
and constructed in accordance with Section R322. Buildings and structures that are located in more than 
one flood hazard area shall comply with the provisions associated with the most restrictive flood hazard 
area. Buildings and structures located in whole or in part in identified floodways shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance with ASCE 24.  
 
R301.2.4.1 Alternative provisions. Deleted. 
 
R309.3 [Garages and Carports] Flood hazard areas. For buildings located in flood hazard areas as 
established by Table R301.2(1), garage floors shall be: 

1. Elevated to or above the design flood elevation as determined in Section R322; or 
2. Located below the design flood elevation provided that they are at or above grade on not less 
than one side, are used solely for parking, building access or storage, meet the requirements of 
Section R322 and are otherwise constructed in accordance with this code.  

 
 

SECTION R322: FLOOD-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION 
 
R322.1 General. Buildings and structures constructed in whole or in part in flood hazard areas, including 
A or V Zones and Coastal A Zones, as established in Table R301.2(1), and substantial improvement and 
restoration of substantial damage of buildings and structures in flood hazard areas, shall be designed and 
constructed in accordance with the provisions contained in this section. Buildings and structures that are 
located in more than one flood hazard area shall comply with the provisions associated with the most 
restrictive flood hazard area. Buildings and structures located in whole or in part in identified floodways 
shall be designed and constructed in accordance with ASCE 24. 

 
R322.1.1 Alternative provisions. Deleted. 
 
R322.1.2 Structural systems. Structural systems of buildings and structures shall be designed, 
connected and anchored to resist flotation, collapse or permanent lateral movement due to structural 
loads and stresses from flooding equal to the design flood elevation. 
 
R322.1.3 Flood-resistant construction. Buildings and structures erected in areas prone to flooding shall 
be constructed by methods and practices that minimize flood damage. 
 
R322.1.4 Establishing the design flood elevation. The design flood elevation shall be used to define 
flood hazard areas. At a minimum, the design flood elevation shall be the higher of the following: 

http://codes.iccsafe.org/app/book/toc/2015/New_Jersey/building/index.html


2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  9 

1. The base flood elevation at the depth of peak elevation of flooding, including wave height, that 
has a 1 percent (100-year flood) or greater chance of being equaled or exceeded in any given 
year; or 
2. The elevation of the design flood associated with the area designated on a flood hazard map 
adopted by the community, or otherwise legally designated. 

 
R322.1.4.1 Determination of design flood elevations. If design flood elevations are not 
specified, the building official is authorized to require the applicant to comply with either of the 
following: 

1. Obtain and reasonably use data available from a federal, state or other source; or 
2. Determine the design flood elevation in accordance with accepted hydrologic and 
hydraulic engineering practices used to define special flood hazard areas. Determinations 
shall be undertaken by a registered design professional who shall document that the 
technical methods used reflect currently accepted engineering practice. Studies, 
analyses and computations shall be submitted in sufficient detail to allow thorough review 
and approval. 

 
R322.1.4.2 Determination of impacts. In riverine flood hazard areas where design flood 
elevations are specified but floodways have not been designated, the applicant shall demonstrate 
that the effect of the proposed buildings and structures on design flood elevations, including fill, 
when combined with other existing and anticipated flood hazard area encroachments, will not 
increase the design flood elevation more than 1 foot (305 mm) at any point within the jurisdiction. 

 
R322.1.5 Lowest floor. The lowest floor shall be the lowest floor of the lowest enclosed area, including 
basement, and excluding any unfinished flood-resistant enclosure that is useable solely for vehicle 
parking, building access or limited storage provided that such enclosure is not built so as to render the 
building or structure in violation of this section. 
 
R322.1.6 Protection of mechanical, plumbing and electrical systems. Electrical systems, equipment 
and components; heating, ventilating, air conditioning; plumbing appliances and plumbing fixtures; duct 
systems; and other service equipment shall be located at or above the elevation required in Section 
R322.2 or R322.3. If replaced as part of a substantial improvement, electrical systems, equipment and 
components; heating, ventilating, air conditioning and plumbing appliances and plumbing fixtures; duct 
systems; and other service equipment shall meet the requirements of this section. Systems, fixtures, and 
equipment and components shall not be mounted on or penetrate through walls intended to break away 
under flood loads. 

Exception: Locating electrical systems, equipment and components; heating, ventilating, air 
conditioning; plumbing appliances and plumbing fixtures; duct systems; and other service 
equipment is permitted below the elevation required in Section R322.2 or R322.3 provided that 
they are designed and installed to prevent water from entering or accumulating within the 
components and to resist hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and stresses, including the effects 
of buoyancy, during the occurrence of flooding to the design flood elevation in accordance with 
ASCE 24. Electrical wiring systems are permitted to be located below the required elevation 
provided that they conform to the provisions of the electrical part of this code for wet locations. 

 
R322.1.7 Protection of water supply and sanitary sewage systems. New and replacement water 
supply systems shall be designed to minimize or eliminate infiltration of flood waters into the systems in 
accordance with the plumbing provisions of this code. New and replacement sanitary sewage systems 
shall be designed to minimize or eliminate infiltration of floodwaters into systems and discharges from 
systems into floodwaters in accordance with the plumbing subcode (N.J.A.C. 5:23-3.15).  
 
R322.1.8 Flood-resistant materials. Building materials and installation methods used for flooring and 
interior and exterior walls and wall coverings below the elevation required in Section R322.2 or R322.3 
shall be flood damage-resistant materials that conform to the provisions of FEMA TB-2.  
 



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  10 

R322.1.9 Manufactured homes. The bottom of the frame of new manufactured homes on foundations 
that conform to the requirements of Section R322.2 or R322.3, as applicable, shall be elevated to or 
above the elevations specified in Section R322.2 (flood hazard areas including A Zones) or R322.3 in 
coastal high-hazard areas (V Zones and Coastal A Zones). The anchor and tie-down requirements of the 
applicable state or federal requirements shall apply. The foundation and anchorage of manufactured 
homes to be located in identified floodways shall be designed and constructed in accordance with ASCE 
24. 
 
R322.1.10 As-built elevation documentation. A registered design professional shall prepare and seal 
documentation of the elevations specified in Section R322.2 or R322.3. 
 
R322.2 Flood hazard areas (including A Zones). Areas that have been determined to be prone to 
flooding and that are not subject to high-velocity wave action shall be designated as flood hazard areas. 
Flood hazard areas that have been delineated as subject to wave heights between 1 ½ feet (457 mm) 
and 3 feet (914 mm) or otherwise designated by the jurisdiction shall be designated as Coastal A Zones 
and are subject to the requirements of Section R322.3. Buildings and structures constructed in whole or 
in part in flood hazard areas shall be designed and constructed in accordance with Sections R322.2.1 
through R322.2.3.  
 
R322.2.1 Elevation requirements. 

1. Buildings and structures in flood hazard areas, including flood hazard areas designated as 
Coastal A Zones, shall have the lowest floors elevated to or above the base flood elevation plus 1 
foot (305 mm), or the design flood elevation, whichever is higher. 
2. In areas of shallow flooding (AO Zones), buildings and structures shall have the lowest floor 
(including basement) elevated to a height above the highest adjacent grade of not less than the 
depth number specified in feet (mm) on the FIRM plus 1 foot (305 mm), or not less than 3 feet (15 
mm) if a depth number is not specified.  
3. Basement floors that are below grade on all sides shall be elevated to or above base flood 
elevation plus 1 foot (305 mm), or the design flood elevation, whichever is higher.  
Exception: Enclosed areas below the design flood elevation, including basements with floors that 
are not below grade on all sides, shall meet the requirements of Section 322.2.2. 

 
R322.2.2 Enclosed area below design flood elevation. Enclosed areas, including crawl spaces, that 
are below the design flood elevation shall: 

1. Be used solely for parking of vehicles, building access or storage. 
2. Be provided with flood openings that meet the following criteria and are installed in accordance 
with Section R322.2.2.1: 
2.1. The total net area of non-engineered openings shall be not less than 1 square inch (645 
mm2) for each square foot (0.093 m2) of enclosed area where the enclosed area is measured on 
the exterior of the enclosure walls, or the openings shall be designed as engineered openings 
and the construction documents shall include a statement by a registered design professional that 
the design of the openings will provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls 
by allowing for the automatic entry and exit of floodwaters as specified in Section 2.7.2.2 of ASCE 
24.  
2.2. Openings shall be not less than 3 inches (76 mm) in any direction in the plane of the wall. 
2.3 The presence of louvers, blades, screens and faceplates or other covers and devices shall 
allow the automatic flow of floodwater into and out of the enclosed areas and shall be accounted 
for in the determination of the net open area.  

 
R322.2.2.1 Installation of openings. The walls of enclosed areas shall have openings installed 
such that:  

1. There shall be not less than two openings on different sides of each enclosed area; if a 
building has more than one enclosed area below the design flood elevation, each area 
shall have openings. 



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  11 

2. The bottom of each opening shall be not more than 1 foot (305 mm) above the higher 
of the final interior grade or floor and the finished exterior grade immediately under each 
opening. 
3. Openings shall be permitted to be installed in doors and windows; doors and windows 
without installed openings do not meet the requirements of this section. 

 
R322.2.3 Foundation design and construction. Foundation walls for buildings and structures erected in 
flood hazard areas shall meet the requirements of Chapter 4. For buildings supported by piles, the design 
and methods of construction shall meet the applicable criteria of ASCE 24. 

Exception: Unless designed in accordance with Section R404: 
1. The unsupported height of 6-inch (152 mm) plain masonry walls shall be not more than 3 feet 
(914 mm). 
2. The unsupported height of 8-inch (203 mm) plain masonry walls shall be not more than 4 feet 
(914 mm). 
3. The unsupported height of 8-inch (203 mm) reinforced masonry walls shall be not more than 8 
feet (2438 mm). 

For the purpose of this exception, unsupported height is the distance from the finished 
grade of the under-floor space to the top of the wall. 

 
R322.2.4 Tanks. Underground tanks shall be anchored to prevent flotation, collapse and lateral 
movement under conditions of the base flood. Above-ground tanks shall be installed at or above the 
elevation required in Section R322.2.1 or shall be anchored to prevent flotation, collapse and lateral 
movement under conditions of the base flood. 
 
R322.3 Coastal high-hazard areas (including V Zones and Coastal A Zones, where designated). 
Areas that have been determined to be subject to wave heights in excess of 3 feet (914 mm) or subject to 
high-velocity wave action or wave-induced erosion shall be designated as coastal high-hazard areas. 
Flood hazard areas that have been designated as subject to wave heights between 1 ½ (457 mm) and 3 
feet (914 mm) or otherwise designated by the jurisdiction shall be designated as Coastal A Zones. 
Buildings and structures constructed in whole or in part in coastal high-hazard areas and Coastal A 
Zones, where designated, shall be designed and constructed in accordance with Sections R322.3.1 and 
ASCE 24. 
 
R322.3.1 Location and site preparation. 

1. Buildings and structures shall be located landward of the reach of mean high tide.  
2. For any alteration of sand dunes and mangrove stands, the building official shall require 

submission of an engineering analysis that demonstrates that the proposed alteration will not 
increase the potential for flood damage. 

 
R322.3.2 Elevation requirements. Deleted. [See R322.3; elevation requirements are in ASCE 24] 
 
R322.3.3 Foundations. Deleted. [See R322.3; foundation requirements are in ASCE 24] 
 
R322.3.4 Walls below design flood elevation. Deleted. [See R322.3; wall requirements are in ASCE 
24] 
 
R322.3.5 Enclosed areas below design flood elevation. Deleted. [See R322.3; enclosure requirements 
are in ASCE 24] 

  
R322.3.5.1 Protection of building envelope. Deleted. [See R322.3; protection requirement is in ASCE 
24] 
 
R322.3.6 Construction documents. Deleted. [See § 5:23-2.15(f)1.ix.(1) Exception] 
 
R322.3.7 Tanks. Underground tanks shall be anchored to prevent flotation, collapse and lateral 
movement under conditions of the base flood. Above-ground tanks shall be installed at or above the 



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  12 

elevation required in Section R322.3.2. Where elevated on platforms, the platforms shall be cantilevered 
from or knee braced to the building or shall be supported on foundations that conform to the requirements 
of Section R322.3.  
 
 
R326.1 [Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs] General. The design and construction of pools and 
spas shall comply with the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code. 
 
 
R401.1 [Foundations] Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and 
construction of the foundation and foundation spaces for buildings. In addition to the provisions of this 
chapter, the design and construction of foundations in flood hazard areas shall meet the provisions of 
Section R322. Wood foundations shall be designed and installed in accordance with AWC PWF.  

Exception: The provisions of this chapter shall be permitted to be used for wood foundations 
only in the following situations: 
1. In buildings that have no more than two floors and a roof. 
2. Where interior basement and foundation walls are constructed at intervals not exceeding 50 
feet (15240 mm). 

    Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category D0, D1 or D2 shall be designed in accordance with 
accepted engineering practice. 
 
R401.2 [Foundations] Requirements. Foundation construction shall be capable of accommodating all 
loads according to Section R301 and of transmitting the resulting loads to the supporting soil. Fill soils 
that support footings and foundations shall be designed, installed and tested in accordance with accepted 
engineering practice. Gravel fill used as footings for wood and precast concrete foundations shall comply 
with Section R403. 
 
R401.3 [Foundations] Drainage. Surface drainage shall be diverted to a storm sewer conveyance or 
other approved point of collection that does not create a hazard. Lots shall be graded to drain surface 
water away from foundation walls. The grade shall fall a minimum of 6 inches (152 mm) within the first 10 
feet (3048 mm). 

Exception: Where lot lines, walls, slopes or other physical barriers prohibit 6 inches (152 mm) of 
fall within 10 feet (3048 mm), drains or swales shall be constructed to ensure drainage away from 
the structure. Impervious surfaces within 10 feet (3048 mm) of the building foundation shall be 
sloped a minimum of 2 percent away from the building. 

 
R404.1.9.5 [Isolated masonry piers] Masonry piers in flood hazard areas. Masonry piers for dwellings 
in flood hazard areas shall be designed in accordance with Section R322.  
 
R408.6 [Under-Floor Space] Finished grade. The finished grade of under-floor surface shall be 
permitted to be located at the bottom of the footings; however, where there is evidence that the 
groundwater table can rise to within 6 inches (152 mm) of the finished floor at the building perimeter or 
where there is evidence that the surface water does not readily drain from the building site, the grade in 
the under-floor space shall be as high as the outside finished grade, unless an approved drainage system 
is provided. 
 
R408.7 [Under-Floor Space] Flood resistance. For buildings located in flood hazard areas as 
established in Table R301.2(1):  

1. Walls enclosing the under-floor space shall be provided with flood openings in accordance with 
Section R322.2.2. 
2. The finished ground level of the under-floor space shall be equal to or higher than the outside 
finished ground level on at least one side. 
Exception: Under-floor spaces that meet the requirements of FEMA TB-11. 

 
 



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  13 

R506.2.1 [Concrete Floors (on Ground)] Fill. Fill material shall be free of vegetation and foreign 
material. The fill shall be compacted to ensure uniform support of the slab, and except where approved, 
the fill depths shall not exceed 24 inches (610 mm) for clean sand or gravel and 8 inches (203 mm) for 
earth. 
 
M1301.1.1 [General Mechanical System Requirements] Flood-resistant installation. In flood hazard 
areas as established by Table R301.2(1), mechanical appliances, equipment and systems shall be 
located or installed in accordance with Section R322.1.6. 
 
M1401.5 [Heating and Cooling Equipment] Flood hazard. In flood hazard areas as established by 
Table R301.2(1), heating and cooling equipment and appliances shall be located or installed in 
accordance with Section R322.1.6. 
 
M1601.4.10 [Duct Construction] Flood hazard areas. In flood hazard areas as established by Table 
R301.2(1), duct systems shall be located or installed in accordance with Section R322.1.6. 
 
M1701.2 [Combustion Air] Opening location. In flood hazard areas as established in Table R301.2(1), 
combustion air openings shall be located at or above the elevation required in Section R322.2.1 or 
R322.3.2. 
 
M2001.4 [Boilers and Water Heaters] Flood-resistant installation. In flood hazard areas established in 
Table R301.2(1), boilers, water heaters and their control systems shall be located or installed in 
accordance with Section R322.1.6. 
 
M2201.6 [Special Piping and Storage Systems] Flood-resistant installation. In flood hazard areas as 
established by Table R301.2(1), tanks shall be installed in accordance with Section R322.2.4 or Section 
R322.3.7.  
 
G2404.7 (301.11) [Fuel Gas] Flood hazard. For structures located in flood hazard areas, the appliance, 
equipment and system installations regulated by this code shall be located at or above the elevation 
required by Section R322 for utilities and attendant equipment. 

Exception: The appliance, equipment and system installations regulated by this code are 
permitted to be located below the elevation required by Section R322 for utilities and attendant 
equipment provided that they are designed and installed to prevent water from entering or 
accumulating within the components and to resist hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and 
stresses, including the effects of buoyancy, during the occurrence of flooding to such elevation. 

 
[Note:  plumbing requirements are in the plumbing subcode] 
 
 

CHAPTER 44  REFERENCED STANDARDS 
 
ASCE/SEI 24-14  Flood Resistant Design and Construction 
 
FEMA-TB-2—08   Flood Damage-Resistant Materials Requirement 
 
FEMA-TB-11—01  Crawlspace Construction for Buildings Located in Special Flood Hazard Areas  
 
 

 
  



2015 NJ UCC (flood provisions, prepared October, 2015)  14 

N.J.A.C. § 5:23-6 Rehabilitation Subcode  

http://www.state.nj.us/dca/divisions/codes/codreg/ucc.html 

 
§ 5:23-6.3A Flood-resistant construction 
(a) For buildings in designated flood hazard areas, any work that constitutes a substantial improvement or 
repair of substantial damage of the existing building, as determined by the local floodplain administrator, 
shall comply with the applicable flood-resistant construction requirements below. As defined in the 
National Flood Insurance Program rules, 44 CFR 59.1, " 'substantial improvement' means any 
reconstruction, rehabilitation, addition, or other improvement of a structure, the cost of which equals or 
exceeds 50 percent of the market value of the structure before the 'start of construction' of the 
improvement. This term includes structures which have incurred 'substantial damage,' regardless of the 
actual repair work performed." As defined in these Federal rules, " 'substantial damage' means damage of 
any origin sustained by a structure whereby the cost of restoring the structure to its before damaged 
condition would equal or exceed 50 percent of the market value of the structure before the damage 
occurred." 

1. Group R-5 buildings: Sections R301.2.4, R322, R406.1.2.1, R408.7, M1301.1.1, M1401.5, 
M1601.4.9, M1701.2, M2001.4, M2201.6, and G2404.7 of the one- and two-family dwelling 
subcode. 
2. All other buildings: 

i. Building subcode: Sections 801.5, 1203.3.2, Exception 5, 1403.5, 1403.6, 1603.1.7, 
1605.2.2, 1605.3.1.2, 1612, 1804.4, and 1805.1.2.1. 
ii. Mechanical subcode: Sections 301.13, 401.4, 501.2, 602.4, 603.13, 1206.9.1, and 
1305.2.1. 
iii. Fuel gas subcode: Section 301.11. 

http://www.state.nj.us/dca/divisions/codes/codreg/ucc.html

